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Purpose of a Martial Arts Instructor/Trainer (MAIT):

A MAIT is the direct link to the battalion/squadron commanding officer for Marine Corps Martial Arts
Program (MCMAP) techniques, synergizing the mental, character, and combative disciplines of MCMAP to
imbed Marines with the ability to make ethical decisions on and off the battlefield, developing a combat
fitness program for the battalion/squadron, establishing programs to allow Marines the opportunity to
overcome their fears, and to advise the senior enlisted Marine and commanding officer on how to best
integrate MCMAP training into the unit's training schedule. Integrating MCMAP into not only physical
training sessions but in all evolutions of training in order to sustain what the Marine has learned and to
further the Marines' skills. The tie-ins or the mental and character classes add immense credibility to the
program. Some Marines are still not living up to our ethical standards so it is imperative you consistently
stress the importance of the tie-ins. As a MAI/MAIT, you should strive to 'inspire' your Marines to train in
MCMAP by being out in front of the training and participating in the same MCMAP training they are
undergoing.

A MAI/MAIT should continually seek self-improvement, not only for yourself, but for your Marines as well.
Continually enhance our warrior spirit by becoming an arms carrying professional.

* Are you being or becoming? * Are you the hunted or hunting?

The MAIT should focus a great deal on mentoring the Martial Arts Instructors (MAI) in the unit. This is to
ensure the MAI is carrying out his/her duties in a mature manor and has established a solid training program
allowing Marines the opportunity to further their martial arts skills, both mentally and physically.

The MAIT should view MCMAP as a reflection of our warrior ethos and tie belt advancement to PME, our
warrior ethos, ethics, the senior enlisted Marine's recommendation, the commanding officer's
recommendation, and to practice MCMAP throughout one's career as a lifelong student of the Marine Corps
Martial Arts Program.

When a MAIT sees a Marine with a MCMAP belt, the MAIT internally knows the Marine is not only skilled
in MCMAP but the Marine has earned the belt and is a good ethical leader spiritually connected to his/her
fellow Marines. The epitome of a MARINE!! Being a MAI/MAIT is not a badge but a huge responsibility to
train and lead our Marines to do the right thing, for the right reason, in the right way.
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From reader reviews:

Evelyn Garcia:

The book USMC Marine Corps Martial Arts Tan Gray Green Brown And Black Instructor Manual can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave
the best thing like a book USMC Marine Corps Martial Arts Tan Gray Green Brown And Black Instructor
Manual? A number of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will book can give
many information for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or
data that you take for that, you could give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book USMC
Marine Corps Martial Arts Tan Gray Green Brown And Black Instructor Manual has simple shape but the
truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by open and
read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Randall Blake:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specifically book entitled
USMC Marine Corps Martial Arts Tan Gray Green Brown And Black Instructor Manual your head will drift
away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely will become
your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a guide then become one contact form conclusion and
explanation which maybe you never get prior to. The USMC Marine Corps Martial Arts Tan Gray Green
Brown And Black Instructor Manual giving you an additional experience more than blown away your
thoughts but also giving you useful information for your better life with this era. So now let us explain to you
the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished looking at it,
like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Nicole Norris:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't work at this
point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be USMC Marine Corps Martial Arts Tan Gray Green Brown And
Black Instructor Manual why because the amazing cover that make you consider with regards to the content
will not disappoint you. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your
reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Maurice Conner:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by net on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is
identified as of book USMC Marine Corps Martial Arts Tan Gray Green Brown And Black Instructor
Manual. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could add



your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about book. It
can bring you from one place to other place.
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