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Significantly revised and updated by the American Academy of Pediatrics Committee on Nutrition with
contributions from more than 100 authors, the new seventh edition provides practicing clinicians with
evidence-based guidance on the full spectrum of childhood nutrition issues.

The new seventh edition provides the latest information about nutrient metabolism and nutrition to support
the normal development and health of infants and children who are well, those born with congenital
anomalies or disorders of metabolism, and those with acute and chronic illness.

New in the 7th edition:

- The latest evidence-based guidelines from the AAP on feeding healthy infants and children

- Current policies and practice recommendations from the AAP Committee on Nutrition

- Several new chapters and appendices have been added, including chapters on school and day care nutrition;
gene and nutrient interaction; and metabolic programming.

- Recent advances and developments on topics that arise frequently in pediatric practice: breastfeeding, fast
foods, vegetarian diets, persistent newborn diarrhea, preterm infant nutrition needs, chronic obesity, vitamin
supplementation, and more

- Appendices of more than 50 tables including dietary allowances, energy requirements, composition of
human milk and infant formulas, MyPlate, and more

- More than 20 growth charts for very low and low birth weights; full-term infants, children, and
adolescents; down syndrome; and more

- Updates listings of resources for you and your patients, including printed materials, government agencies,
and Web sites
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From reader reviews:

Audrey Thompson:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or perhaps goal; it
means that reserve has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They
are reading whatever they get because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person who
don't like examining a book? Sometime, person feel need book if they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Pediatric Nutrition.

Dominick Tran:

This Pediatric Nutrition usually are reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The
reason why of this Pediatric Nutrition can be on the list of great books you must have is giving you more
than just simple examining food but feed you actually with information that probably will shock your
previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions
in the e-book and printed versions. Beside that this Pediatric Nutrition giving you an enormous of experience
like rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day exercise. So
, let's have it appreciate reading.

Daniel Colon:

Typically the book Pediatric Nutrition has a lot associated with on it. So when you check out this book you
can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. Tom makes some research
before write this book. This book very easy to read you may get the point easily after reading this article
book.

Ian Hall:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will
make anyone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
much easier to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers,
book, and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual
book that recommended to your account is Pediatric Nutrition this book consist a lot of the information on
the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how do the world has grown up. The
vocabulary styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some exploration
when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book ideal all of you.
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