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Arthur Conan Doyle is best remembered today as the creator of the world's most famous detective, Sherlock
Holmes. But he was much more than that. Apart from being a popular and prolific author - his literary output
included historical novels, science fiction and histories of the Boer War and the First World War - his
passion for a wide range of subjects make him a colourful and fascinating character in his own right. He was
an early champion of the Channel Tunnel, he played cricket for the MCC, was a staunch advocate of
Spiritualism, introduced cross country skiing to Switzerland and he was acquainted with many of the notable
public figures of the late Victorian and Edwardian period. His fascinating account of his life is a wonderful
record of a unique individual. This volume has the added bonus of a perceptive and illuminating introduction
by David Stuart Davies who throws some light into the darker areas of Conan Doyle's life.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Woodruff:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right
now, people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this specific Sir Arthur Conan Doyle:
Memories and Adventures (Wordsworth Literary Lives) book as beginning and daily reading book. Why,
because this book is greater than just a book.

Rosa Reid:

The guide with title Sir Arthur Conan Doyle: Memories and Adventures (Wordsworth Literary Lives)
contains a lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book.
This particular book exist new know-how the information that exist in this book represented the condition of
the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This specific
book will bring you throughout new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on your smart
phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Shaun Sae:

Precisely why? Because this Sir Arthur Conan Doyle: Memories and Adventures (Wordsworth Literary
Lives) is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will zap
you with the secret this inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in
such wonderful way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey
the meaning completely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going
to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have got such as help
improving your expertise and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold off having that book? If
I were you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Suzanne Palmer:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Try to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
look likes. Maybe you answer is usually Sir Arthur Conan Doyle: Memories and Adventures (Wordsworth
Literary Lives) why because the excellent cover that make you consider concerning the content will not
disappoint you actually. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your
reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.
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