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Featuring contributions from leading experts, the Road and Off-Road Vehicle System Dynamics
Handbook provides comprehensive, authoritative coverage of all the major issues involved in road vehicle
dynamic behavior. While the focus is on automobiles, this book also highlights motorcycles, heavy
commercial vehicles, and off-road vehicles.

The authors of the individual chapters, both from automotive industry and universities, address basic issues,
but also include references to significant papers for further reading. Thus the handbook is devoted both to the
beginner, wishing to acquire basic knowledge on a specific topic, and to the experienced engineer or
scientist, wishing to have up-to-date information on a particular subject. It can also be used as a textbook for
master courses at universities.

The handbook begins with a short history of road and off-road vehicle dynamics followed by detailed, state-
of-the-art chapters on modeling, analysis and optimization in vehicle system dynamics, vehicle concepts and
aerodynamics, pneumatic tires and contact wheel-road/off-road, modeling vehicle subsystems, vehicle
dynamics and active safety, man-vehicle interaction, intelligent vehicle systems, and road accident
reconstruction and passive safety.

Provides extensive coverage of modeling, simulation, and analysis techniques●

Surveys all vehicle subsystems from a vehicle dynamics point of view●

Focuses on pneumatic tires and contact wheel-road/off-road ●

Discusses intelligent vehicle systems technologies and active safety●

Considers safety factors and accident reconstruction procedures●

Includes chapters written by leading experts from all over the world●

This text provides an applicable source of information for all people interested in a deeper understanding of
road vehicle dynamics and related problems.
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From reader reviews:

George Finch:

Throughout other case, little folks like to read book Road and Off-Road Vehicle System Dynamics
Handbook. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Provided that we know about how
is important a book Road and Off-Road Vehicle System Dynamics Handbook. You can add knowledge and
of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can learn
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple point until wonderful
thing you could know that. In this era, you can open a book or maybe searching by internet gadget. It is
called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's read.

Scott Seward:

What do you regarding book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you need something
to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have spare
time to complete others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have spare time? What did you
do? Every individual has many questions above. They need to answer that question mainly because just their
can do that. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start
from on guardería until university need this particular Road and Off-Road Vehicle System Dynamics
Handbook to read.

Carolyn Berndt:

Typically the book Road and Off-Road Vehicle System Dynamics Handbook will bring that you the new
experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the event you
try to find new book to read, this book very appropriate to you. The book Road and Off-Road Vehicle
System Dynamics Handbook is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book in the official
web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Charles Krueger:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their reader with their story as well as
their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the ability about
something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are
many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their talent in writing,
they also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of them is this Road and Off-Road
Vehicle System Dynamics Handbook.
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