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Aspiring ballerina-slash-amateur detective Dani Spevak is back in this humorous short story!

Dani and her friends are spending spring break in beautiful Sedona, Arizona for the annual Southwest Teen
Arts Festival. But how can she concentrate on performing when her not-quite-boyfriend is in town filming
the lead in a hot new vampire movie... and he was seen kissing his costar?

“I really dug Amanda Brice’s Twilight parody. So awesome!”
—Mari Mancusi, author of Skater Boy

"The best things don't only happen when you're dancing...they also happen when you're reading Amanda
Brice!"
—NY Times Bestselling Author Gemma Halliday

This short story stands alone and can be read in any order, however chronologically it is "Book #2.5" in the
Dani Spevak Mystery Series, following CODENAME: DANCER (Book #1) and POINTE OF NO RETURN
(Book #2). PAS DE DEATH (Book #3) will be released in February 2013. Sign up at Amanda's website to
be notified of its release. Register for the newsletter by January 20, and you'll be entered to win a $250 gift
card!

(Story originally appeared in the ETERNAL SPRING young adult anthology.)
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From reader reviews:

Christina Epp:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time
to take a go walking, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book allowed Barre
Hopping at Midnight (The Dani Spevak Mystery Series)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You already
know beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree
with its opinion or you have some other opinion?

Judith Mandel:

The actual book Barre Hopping at Midnight (The Dani Spevak Mystery Series) will bring that you the new
experience of reading any book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In case you try to find
new book to learn, this book very ideal to you. The book Barre Hopping at Midnight (The Dani Spevak
Mystery Series) is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from official web site,
so you can quickly to read the book.

Desiree Herdon:

The publication untitled Barre Hopping at Midnight (The Dani Spevak Mystery Series) is the publication that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you. The
language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was
did a lot of exploration when write the book, hence the information that they share to you personally is
absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Barre Hopping at Midnight (The Dani Spevak Mystery
Series) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Matthew Simons:

Reading a book to get new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When you
examine a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what
kinds of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics,
and also soon. The Barre Hopping at Midnight (The Dani Spevak Mystery Series) provide you with new
experience in looking at a book.
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