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In 1942, the shadow of modern war reached Australia's shores for the first time. In this compelling volume,
leading historians explore why 1942 was such a pivotal year in Australia's history, and explain how the
nation confronted some of its greatest challenges. This broad ranging study covers key issues from political,
economic and home front reform to the establishment of a new partnership with the United States; the role of
the Air Force and the Navy; the bombing of Darwin; as well as the battles of Kokoda, Milne Bay, the
Beachheads and Guadalcanal. Australia 1942 provides a unique and in-depth exploration of the controversy
surrounding the potential for invasion. Japanese and Australian historians offer perspectives on Japanese
military intentions and strategies towards Australia and the south Pacific. Generously illustrated, it is
essential reading for anyone interested in one of Australia's most decisive and critical years.
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From reader reviews:

Warner Samuels:

This Australia 1942: In the Shadow of War (Australian Army History) book is simply not ordinary book, you
have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book will be information
inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper a person read a lot of
information you will get. This kind of Australia 1942: In the Shadow of War (Australian Army History)
without we understand teach the one who examining it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't
become worry Australia 1942: In the Shadow of War (Australian Army History) can bring when you are and
not make your case space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop
even cellphone. This Australia 1942: In the Shadow of War (Australian Army History) having great
arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Donald Lester:

The feeling that you get from Australia 1942: In the Shadow of War (Australian Army History) will be the
more deep you searching the information that hide within the words the more you get thinking about reading
it. It does not mean that this book is hard to know but Australia 1942: In the Shadow of War (Australian
Army History) giving you excitement feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in specific way that
can be understood by simply anyone who read this because the author of this book is well-known enough.
This particular book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go
to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having that Australia 1942: In the
Shadow of War (Australian Army History) instantly.

Dan Flood:

Australia 1942: In the Shadow of War (Australian Army History) can be one of your nice books that are
good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that can
increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The
author giving his/her effort to set every word into joy arrangement in writing Australia 1942: In the Shadow
of War (Australian Army History) nevertheless doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest
along with based confirm resource information that maybe you can be among it. This great information may
drawn you into brand new stage of crucial thinking.

Cheri Tow:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to learn a book. When you examine a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, due
to the fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel, comics, along with soon.
The Australia 1942: In the Shadow of War (Australian Army History) will give you a new experience in



reading a book.
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