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Now in paperback, the Los Angeles Times bestseller that takes a riveting look at the life and times of golf
legend Bobby Jones In the wake of the stock market crash and the dawn of the Great Depression, a ray of
light emerged from the world of sports in the summer of 1930. Bobby Jones, a 28-year-old amateur golfer,
mounted a campaign against the record books. In four months, he conquered the British Amateur
Championship, the British Open, the United States Open, and finally the United States Amateur
Championship, an achievement so extraordinary that writers dubbed it the Grand Slam. No one has ever
repeated it. Mark Frost uses a wealth of original research to provide an unprecedented intimate portrait of
golf great Bobby Jones. In the tradition of The Greatest Game Ever Played, The Grand Slam blends social
history with sports biography, captivating the imagination and engaging the reader. The Grand Slam is a
biography not to be missed.
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From reader reviews:

Karen Johnson:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this particular aren't like that. This The Grand Slam: Bobby Jones, America, and the Story of Golf book is
readable simply by you who hate the straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for
enjoyable examining experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The
writer involving The Grand Slam: Bobby Jones, America, and the Story of Golf content conveys thinking
easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it
just different by means of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking The Grand Slam: Bobby Jones, America, and
the Story of Golf is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Jesse Reid:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
any time those information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
of those possibilities will not happen with you if you take The Grand Slam: Bobby Jones, America, and the
Story of Golf as your daily resource information.

Nancy Figaro:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book,
and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is The Grand Slam: Bobby Jones, America, and the Story of Golf this
publication consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. That book was represented
how does the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand.
The actual writer made some research when he makes this book. This is why this book suited all of you.

Brett Munoz:

You can get this The Grand Slam: Bobby Jones, America, and the Story of Golf by browse the bookstore or
Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties to your knowledge.
Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by simply written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by
simply e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching
what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is
most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose appropriate



ways for you.
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