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No country on earth has suffered a more bitter history in modern times than China. In the second half of the
nineteenth century, it was viewed as doomed to extinction. Its imperial rulers, heading an anachronistic
regime, were brought low by enormous revolts, shifting social power patterns, republican revolutionaries,
Western incursions to "split the Chinese melon" and a disastrous defeat by Japan.

The presence of predatory foreigners has often been blamed for China's troubles, but the much greater cause
came from within China itself. In the early twentieth century, the empire was succeeded by warlordism on a
massive scale, internal divisions, incompetent rule, savage fighting between the government and the
Communists, and a fourteen-year invasion from Japan. Four years of civil war after 1945 led to the Maoist
era, with its purges and repression; the disastrous Great Leap Forward; a famine that killed tens of millions;
and the Cultural Revolution.

Yet from this long trauma, China has emerged amazingly in the last three decades as an economic
powerhouse set to play a major global political role, its future posing one of the great questions for the
twenty-first century as it grapples with enormous internal challenges. Understanding how that transformation
came about and what China constitutes today means understanding its epic journey since 1850 and
recognizing how the past influences the present.

Jonathan Fenby tells this turbulent story with brilliance and insight, spanning a unique historical panorama,
with an extraordinary cast of characters and a succession of huge events. As Confucius said, To see the
future, one must grasp the past.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Spangler:

The knowledge that you get from Modern China: The Fall and Rise of a Great Power, 1850 to the Present is
the more deep you excavating the information that hide inside words the more you get considering reading it.
It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Modern China: The Fall and Rise of a Great Power,
1850 to the Present giving you buzz feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in a number of way
that can be understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this publication is well-
known enough. This book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then
can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this kind of
Modern China: The Fall and Rise of a Great Power, 1850 to the Present instantly.

William Herold:

The reserve untitled Modern China: The Fall and Rise of a Great Power, 1850 to the Present is the reserve
that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to a
person. The language that author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, therefore the information that they share for your
requirements is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Modern China: The Fall and Rise of a
Great Power, 1850 to the Present from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Mary Jones:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they
will get large amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we
will say absolutely without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of
activity are there when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer can unlimited right.
Then ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, often
the book you have read is usually Modern China: The Fall and Rise of a Great Power, 1850 to the Present.

Lyla Jackson:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
was exactly added. This book Modern China: The Fall and Rise of a Great Power, 1850 to the Present was
filled concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your research competence.
Some people has various feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you
can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you
simply wanted.
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