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A master stonemason imparts the fundamentals of building traditional New England-style dry stone
walls.

In this elegant, literate primer, a master stonemason imparts the fundamentals of building traditional New
England-style dry stone walls, along with thoughts on the history, aesthetics, and philosophy of the craft of
placing stone. In this eminently readable primer on the fundamentals of placing stone, Kevin Gardner distills
25 years of experience in building and repairing New England-style dry stone walls into principles and
practices that are adaptable to a wide variety of designs and circumstances. In addition to directions on
building basic stone walls, he also demystifies steps, wells, ramps, walkways, and may other forms of dry
masonry. Gardner also discusses the philosophy behind the repair and restoration of old walls, and gives the
beginning wall builder ways to think about the place of the stone wall within the landscape. Along the way,
Gardner considers the mythology of the stone wall and its place in the New England imagination. And he
explores the history, philosophy, and aesthetics of working with stone in a book that will bring as much
pleasure to armchair craftsmen as it will valuable instruction to the beginning wall builder. Selected as one of
2001's Best Gift Books by The Times of Trenton, New Jersey; one of the 50 best nonfiction books of 2001
by the Christian Science Monitor. 22 black & white illustrations, glossary, bibliography, index.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Froelich:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on
guys this specific aren't like that. This The Granite Kiss: Traditions and Techniques of Building New
England Stone Walls book is readable by means of you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the
details here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that
want to offer to you. The writer of The Granite Kiss: Traditions and Techniques of Building New England
Stone Walls content conveys prospect easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are
not different in the written content but it just different in the form of it. So , do you still thinking The Granite
Kiss: Traditions and Techniques of Building New England Stone Walls is not loveable to be your top record
reading book?

Jessica Ball:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
when those information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take The Granite Kiss: Traditions and Techniques of Building
New England Stone Walls as the daily resource information.

Richelle Johnson:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the name The Granite
Kiss: Traditions and Techniques of Building New England Stone Walls suitable to you? Often the book was
written by renowned writer in this era. The book untitled The Granite Kiss: Traditions and Techniques of
Building New England Stone Wallsis the main one of several books in which everyone read now. That book
was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new way of
measuring that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, therefore all
of people can easily to recognise the core of this publication. This book will give you a large amount of
information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world with this book.

Rachel Addison:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or their
particular friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your free
time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually option to fill your no cost time/ holiday. The first
thing that you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to attempt look for book,



may be the book untitled The Granite Kiss: Traditions and Techniques of Building New England Stone
Walls can be very good book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.
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