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An eleven year old boy wakes up in a bedroom. He doesn’t know where he is and doesn’t remember who he
is. He finds a very strange household whose members insist he is part of their family. When the creepy dad
starts asking him strange questions, the boy notes his observations in a journal, to solve the puzzle of his very
peculiar situation. A mystery with twists and turns Dan Brown would admire. Editorial Reviews: From
Stacey Turner, of The Author Spot “For a very entertaining, quick read- look no farther than The Strange
Journal of the Boy Henry. It's compelling, amusing and entertaining all in one. Let's face it, good writing is
good writing regardless of the age group it's intended for. Fans of suspense & intrigue will really be
pleased.” From Nordic Reader’s Ingmar Berglund: “A now commonplace idea made new; a complex plot
laid out in simple detail. Henry’s Journal is one hell of a read.” Excerpt: Entry 1 I was woken, this morning,
by a man’s voice. “Time to get up, son,” is what I heard, over and over. So I opened my eyes and saw him.
He was sitting on the bed, staring down at me. “You sleep okay?” he asked. And he smiled and placed a
hand on my shoulder. “My little prince,” he continued. “You sleep okay?” I didn’t know how to answer him.
Because I didn’t know this man. I’d never seen him before in my life. He had black hair and a mustache and
light blue eyes. His skin was very pale. Almost pinkish, like he’d just taken a bath. He had big hands and
long arms. “You sleep okay?” he asked me again. “I think so,” I told him. “Well, time to get up. You and
your brother both.” And he looked across the room, so I looked there too. I saw another bed with a boy about
my age. He wore blue pajamas, and was laying on his stomach; but his eyes were on me. His head was
shaved all around the bottom, leaving a brown clump on top. And I didn’t know him either. “Where am I?” I
asked the man. “Home, of course,” the man said. “Where else?” I didn’t have an answer for him. I wanted to
panic. Am I crazy? Or was he? What if he was? I better just play along, I decided. “Let me know if you start
feeling faint or dizzy, Henry,” the man said. Henry. I’m pretty sure that that’s my name. “You’ve been ill,”
he said. “Anyway, I’m making breakfast and you’re gonna like it.” He rose, and I saw that he was tall. He
sighed and smiled at the same time, then left the room. The boy stared at me and I stared at him. It was
weird. We just looked at each other for like a whole minute. Then he got up and walked out too. I looked
around at the room. The walls are a light blue, and there’s a map of the world, another of the universe, and a
Periodic Table. There’s also a picture of a sword and a shield. A round window hangs above the boy’s bed.
The glass is blurred, so you can’t really see anything outside. You can only tell that there’s sunlight. Aside
from our two beds, there’re two desks. I didn’t know this room. I tried to remember what my room should be
like. What my dad should look like. And my brother – the man had said the boy was my brother. When did I
have a brother? I couldn’t remember. It was all blank. I wanted to scream: where in the world am I?? I made
a decision to not freak out. Really I just needed to think about this rationally. *
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From reader reviews:

Frank Huynh:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each information they get. How individuals to
be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Studying a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Strange Journal of the Boy Henry -
Books 1 and 2 book since this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the information in this
book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Charles Settles:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information today can get by anyone from everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even an issue. What people must be consider any time those
information which is from the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which one would
work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource then you
obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen throughout you if you take The Strange Journal of the Boy Henry - Books 1 and 2 as the daily
resource information.

Esther Tackett:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared to can
satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be read.
The Strange Journal of the Boy Henry - Books 1 and 2 can be your answer given it can be read by you who
have those short extra time problems.

Meredith Butler:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but novel and The Strange Journal of the Boy Henry - Books 1 and 2
or maybe others sources were given information for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you
feel desire to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or perhaps students especially.
Those textbooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case, beside science guide, any
other book likes The Strange Journal of the Boy Henry - Books 1 and 2 to make your spare time more
colorful. Many types of book like this.
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