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A Tale of Two Cities (1859) is a novel by Charles Dickens, set in London and Paris before and during the
French Revolution. The novel depicts the plight of the French peasantry demoralized by the French
aristocracy in the years leading up to the revolution, the corresponding brutality demonstrated by the
revolutionaries toward the former aristocrats in the early years of the revolution, and many unflattering social
parallels with life in London during the same period. It follows the lives of several characters through these
events. A Tale of Two Cities was published in weekly installments from April 1859 to November 1859 in
Dickens's new literary periodical titled All the Year Round. All but three of Dickens's previous novels had
appeared only as monthly installments. With sales of about 200 million copies, A Tale of Two Cities is the
biggest selling novel in history.
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From reader reviews:

Brenda Carey:

Often the book A Tale of Two Cities (Annotated): A Story of the French Revolution has a lot info on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous author.
Tom makes some research prior to write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can get the
point easily after reading this book.

Levi Ryan:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Try to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't work
is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer could be A Tale of Two Cities (Annotated): A Story of the French Revolution why
because the great cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside
or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly assist you to pick
up this book.

Timothy Pace:

Beside this particular A Tale of Two Cities (Annotated): A Story of the French Revolution in your phone, it
could give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you
will got here is fresh from the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow
village. It is good thing to have A Tale of Two Cities (Annotated): A Story of the French Revolution because
this book offers to your account readable information. Do you often have book but you rarely get what it's all
about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be
questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the idea? Find this book and
also read it from right now!

Jack Murray:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year was exactly
added. This book A Tale of Two Cities (Annotated): A Story of the French Revolution was filled in relation
to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some
people has diverse feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can
really feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you
simply wanted.
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