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Boost your accounting and financial skills with Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 R3

About This Book

Understand Microsoft Dynamics AX financial management and successfully configure and set up your●

software
Manage the AX 2012 R3 financial module with the help of highly useful tips and tricks●

Administer customer relations and plan enterprise resources with this systematic guide●

Who This Book Is For

This book is intended for application consultants, controllers, CFOs, and other professionals who are
engaged in a Microsoft Dynamics AX implementation project. Basic knowledge of financial terms, concepts,
and Microsoft Dynamics AX terminologies is required.

What You Will Learn

Examine the business logic behind the financial functionalities of Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 R3●

Set up and configure the core modules of financial management●

Grasp the key control points of financial management●

Plan and execute an opening balance migration●

Implement the monthly- and year-end closing procedures●

Explore the basic cycles and module integrations●

Discover and implement the inventory costing mechanism●

Use Microsoft Dynamics AX to create financial reports●

In Detail

Microsoft Dynamics AX is a rapidly growing application and is widely used in enterprise organizations.
Because of its ability to maximize business productivity, Microsoft Dynamics AX is one of the fastest-rising
business application packages in the ERP market.

We will start by looking into ERP concepts, implementation needs, and interface design, giving you basic
knowledge of financial management aspects and explaining key concepts along the way. We will tackle each
topic with focused examples and explanations in areas such as general ledgers, accounts payable, accounts
receivable, fixed assets, forecasting, cash and bank management, financial dimensions, and financial
reporting.

By the end of this book, you will have a much richer understanding of Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 R3 and
its empowering capabilities.
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From reader reviews:

Alfred Wolff:

What do you consider book? It is just for students as they are still students or that for all people in the world,
exactly what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
need do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 R3
Financial Management. All type of book is it possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet
options or other social media.

Dennis Simpson:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This reserve Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 R3 Financial Management was filled about
science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has
several feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can really
feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Otis Key:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it.
It is named of book Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 R3 Financial Management. You can add your knowledge
by it. Without departing the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you happier to
read. It is most essential that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.

Katrina Hering:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that query was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So you know
that little person similar to reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update concerning something by book.
A substantial number of sorts of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is Microsoft
Dynamics AX 2012 R3 Financial Management.
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